
 
 

 
 

     

3.6. 3 Number of extension and outreach programs conducted by the institution through NSS/NCC/Red 
cross/YRC etc. during the last five years ( including Government initiated programs such as Swachh Bharat, 
Aids Awareness, Gender Issue, etc. and those organised in collaboration with industry, community and NGOs)  

3.6.4 Average percentage of students participating in extension activities listed at 3.6.3 above during the last 
five years 

Name of 
the 

Scheme 

Organising unit/ 
agency/ 
collaborating 
agency 

Name of the Activity(ies) 
Year of the 

activity 
Link 

Rural 
Internship  Aastha 

Training in child protection, gram 
vikas yojana, digital initiatives 2017 Weblink  

Rural 
Internship  

AGA KHAN Rural 
support 
Programme 

Awareness programs, self help 
groups, FPS, capacity building 
workshops 

2017 Weblink  

Rural 
Internship  

AILSG's 
International 
Centre 

Teaching, Surveys, volunteering 
2017 Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  

Akashay Patra 
Food distribution, surveys 

2017 Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  

Anoopam 
Mission, Yogi 
Arogya Kendra, 
Vithalbhai…cure 
centre,Gyanyagiya 
vidyalayaMita 
Rehabilitation 
centre. 

Teaching physically and mentall 
challenged children, awareness 
camps on hygiene, sanitation 

2017 Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  

Bethany Society-
Marian Centre for 
appropriate 
Technology 

vermi compost preparation, betel 
leaf plates, income generation  

2017 Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  CEE 

Training and capacity building, child 
education,  waste management 

2017 Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  

Chaitanya 

Survey of women empowerment, 
teaching, digital intiatives, skill 
development 

2017 Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  Chetna 

Maternal health camps, food and 
nutirtion awareness 

2017 Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  COHESION 

Child education, sanitation 
awareness, food and nutrition camps 

2017 Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  

DSC Development 
support centre field surveys of panchayats, e-camps 

2017 Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  

GHCL Foundation 
Trust 

Sanitation awareness, primary 
school teaching, literacy awareness 

2017 Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  

Gramin Vikas 
Trust 

Surveys, women self help groups, 
awareness of modern agricultural 

2017 Weblink 

http://intranet.daiict.ac.in/~daiict_nt01/NAAC-CYCLE-2/7.2.1_Supporting-Documents/Rural%20Internships%20Report-Year-2017/Astha_201601222/
http://intranet.daiict.ac.in/~daiict_nt01/NAAC-CYCLE-2/7.2.1_Supporting-Documents/Rural%20Internships%20Report-Year-2017/AKRSPI/
http://intranet.daiict.ac.in/~daiict_nt01/NAAC-CYCLE-2/7.2.1_Supporting-Documents/Rural%20Internships%20Report-Year-2017/AIILSG_201601057/
http://intranet.daiict.ac.in/~daiict_nt01/NAAC-CYCLE-2/7.2.1_Supporting-Documents/Rural%20Internships%20Report-Year-2017/Akshay%20Patra_201601067/
http://intranet.daiict.ac.in/~daiict_nt01/NAAC-CYCLE-2/7.2.1_Supporting-Documents/Rural%20Internships%20Report-Year-2017/Anoopam%20Mission/
http://intranet.daiict.ac.in/~daiict_nt01/NAAC-CYCLE-2/7.2.1_Supporting-Documents/Rural%20Internships%20Report-Year-2017/BethanySociety_201601022/
http://intranet.daiict.ac.in/~daiict_nt01/NAAC-CYCLE-2/7.2.1_Supporting-Documents/Rural%20Internships%20Report-Year-2017/CEE_201601124/
http://intranet.daiict.ac.in/~daiict_nt01/NAAC-CYCLE-2/7.2.1_Supporting-Documents/Rural%20Internships%20Report-Year-2017/Chaitanya_Pune/
http://intranet.daiict.ac.in/~daiict_nt01/NAAC-CYCLE-2/7.2.1_Supporting-Documents/Rural%20Internships%20Report-Year-2017/CHETNA_201601234/
http://intranet.daiict.ac.in/~daiict_nt01/NAAC-CYCLE-2/7.2.1_Supporting-Documents/Rural%20Internships%20Report-Year-2017/Cohesion_20161187/
http://intranet.daiict.ac.in/~daiict_nt01/NAAC-CYCLE-2/7.2.1_Supporting-Documents/Rural%20Internships%20Report-Year-2017/DSC_201601454/
http://intranet.daiict.ac.in/~daiict_nt01/NAAC-CYCLE-2/7.2.1_Supporting-Documents/Rural%20Internships%20Report-Year-2017/GHCL%20Foundation%20Trust%20201601216/
http://intranet.daiict.ac.in/~daiict_nt01/NAAC-CYCLE-2/7.2.1_Supporting-Documents/Rural%20Internships%20Report-Year-2017/GVT%20Dahod_201601008/


techniques 

Rural 
Internship  

Gurukripa 
Sewamay Trust 

Primary school teaching, profession 
and financial surveys, awareness 

2017 Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  

HelpAge India 

arranged medical camps, made 
contract with doctors and medical 
stores 

2017 Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  

Himalayan 
Institute for Env., 
Ecology  & 
Development 
HIFEED 

market survey, interaction with 
farmers 

2017 Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  

Jeevantirth 

training and teaching 
underprivileged students, giving 
information on  women savings 
group 

2017 Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  

Late J V Nariya 

survey on NGO functioning NGO, 
spreading awareness on child 
helpline no., giving information on 
garbage collecting van 

2017 Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  

Maitri Manthan 
Sansthan 

health care awareness for women, 
medical camp, using google form to 
save paper and money 

2017 Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  

Micro Graam 
Social 
Development 
Foundation surveys, study of microgram model 

2017 Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  MIIT 

computer awareness, teaching latest 
computer applications 

2017 Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  

Narmadanagar 
Rural Dev.Society 

livelihood surveys, food and 
nutrition awareness camps 

2017 Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  Navjeevan Trust 

discussion with farmers, survey 
regarding agricultural practices 

2017 Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  P N R Society 

Empowering disabled youths with 
computer skills  

2017 Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  

Pratibha 
Foundation 

teaching English, computer skills, 
women rights awareness camps 

2017 Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  

Prayosha 
Pratishthan 

teaching and volunteering at school 
events, surveys 

2017 Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  

Rural Centre for 
Human 
Interests(Ruchi) 

surveys, slum visit and arranging 
medical camps, water suppy 

2017 Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  

SAFAI 
Vidyala/Env. 
Sanitation Instite 

sanitation awareness, cleaning 
camps 

2017 Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  Samata tribal village visit, child education 

2017 Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  

Sarthi 

surveys, training farmers for 
insurance schemes, encouraging 
villagers for voting during elections 

2017 Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  Setu Abhiyan 

rural governance, interactions with 
panchayats 

2017 Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  

Seva Mandir  

survey on education, training 
teachers for enhancement of 
education quality 

2017 Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  SEWA training rural members, surveys 

2017 Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  SUTRA 

conducting surveys, identify health 
schemes 

2017 Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  Tribhuvandas 

Foundation 

survey on ethical issues and 
addiction, awareness on 
environment and health, air 
pollution, wastes etc. treatment to 

2017 Weblink 

http://intranet.daiict.ac.in/~daiict_nt01/NAAC-CYCLE-2/7.2.1_Supporting-Documents/Rural%20Internships%20Report-Year-2017/GKSM_201601136/
http://intranet.daiict.ac.in/~daiict_nt01/NAAC-CYCLE-2/7.2.1_Supporting-Documents/Rural%20Internships%20Report-Year-2017/Help%20Age_201601133/
http://intranet.daiict.ac.in/~daiict_nt01/NAAC-CYCLE-2/7.2.1_Supporting-Documents/Rural%20Internships%20Report-Year-2017/HIFEED%20Group%202/
http://intranet.daiict.ac.in/~daiict_nt01/NAAC-CYCLE-2/7.2.1_Supporting-Documents/Rural%20Internships%20Report-Year-2017/Jeevantirth_201601044/
http://intranet.daiict.ac.in/~daiict_nt01/NAAC-CYCLE-2/7.2.1_Supporting-Documents/Rural%20Internships%20Report-Year-2017/J.V.Naria_201601126/
http://intranet.daiict.ac.in/~daiict_nt01/NAAC-CYCLE-2/7.2.1_Supporting-Documents/Rural%20Internships%20Report-Year-2017/MaitriManthan%20Sansthan/
http://intranet.daiict.ac.in/~daiict_nt01/NAAC-CYCLE-2/7.2.1_Supporting-Documents/Rural%20Internships%20Report-Year-2017/MicroGraam_201601088/
http://intranet.daiict.ac.in/~daiict_nt01/NAAC-CYCLE-2/7.2.1_Supporting-Documents/Rural%20Internships%20Report-Year-2017/MIIT,%20Sabang,%20West%20Bengal/
http://intranet.daiict.ac.in/~daiict_nt01/NAAC-CYCLE-2/7.2.1_Supporting-Documents/Rural%20Internships%20Report-Year-2017/NARDES_201601018/
http://intranet.daiict.ac.in/~daiict_nt01/NAAC-CYCLE-2/7.2.1_Supporting-Documents/?_ga=2.100923267.307504343.1676359252-725519263.1675962876
http://intranet.daiict.ac.in/~daiict_nt01/NAAC-CYCLE-2/7.2.1_Supporting-Documents/Rural%20Internships%20Report-Year-2017/PNR%20Society,%20Bhavnagar/
http://intranet.daiict.ac.in/~daiict_nt01/NAAC-CYCLE-2/7.2.1_Supporting-Documents/Rural%20Internships%20Report-Year-2017/Pratibha_201601043/
http://intranet.daiict.ac.in/~daiict_nt01/NAAC-CYCLE-2/7.2.1_Supporting-Documents/Rural%20Internships%20Report-Year-2017/PrayoshaPratisthan_201601033/
http://intranet.daiict.ac.in/~daiict_nt01/NAAC-CYCLE-2/7.2.1_Supporting-Documents/Rural%20Internships%20Report-Year-2017/Ruchi,Himachal/
http://intranet.daiict.ac.in/~daiict_nt01/NAAC-CYCLE-2/7.2.1_Supporting-Documents/?_ga=2.100923267.307504343.1676359252-725519263.1675962876
http://intranet.daiict.ac.in/~daiict_nt01/NAAC-CYCLE-2/7.2.1_Supporting-Documents/Rural%20Internships%20Report-Year-2017/Samata,%20Vizag%20-%20007,%20083,%20100,%20425/
http://intranet.daiict.ac.in/~daiict_nt01/NAAC-CYCLE-2/7.2.1_Supporting-Documents/Rural%20Internships%20Report-Year-2017/SARTHI%20,%20Godhar/
http://intranet.daiict.ac.in/~daiict_nt01/NAAC-CYCLE-2/7.2.1_Supporting-Documents/?_ga=2.100923267.307504343.1676359252-725519263.1675962876
http://intranet.daiict.ac.in/~daiict_nt01/NAAC-CYCLE-2/7.2.1_Supporting-Documents/Rural%20Internships%20Report-Year-2017/Sewa%20Mandir%20Udaipur%20Rajasthan/
http://intranet.daiict.ac.in/~daiict_nt01/NAAC-CYCLE-2/7.2.1_Supporting-Documents/Rural%20Internships%20Report-Year-2017/Sewa%20Mandir%20Udaipur%20Rajasthan/
http://intranet.daiict.ac.in/~daiict_nt01/NAAC-CYCLE-2/7.2.1_Supporting-Documents/Rural%20Internships%20Report-Year-2017/SUTRA_201601090/
http://intranet.daiict.ac.in/~daiict_nt01/NAAC-CYCLE-2/7.2.1_Supporting-Documents/Rural%20Internships%20Report-Year-2017/Tribhuvandas%20Foundation_201601084/


malnourished children 

Rural 
Internship  

Uma Edu & Tech 
Society 

developing techincal solutions for 
disabled children 

2017 Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  

Vidya Bhaean 
Society 

teaching at school, dispensary visit, 
software development for patient 
data, sanitation awareness 

2017 Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  

YUVA 
Unstoppable 

Organizing talent programs, teaching 2017 Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  Aadarsh 

tree plantation, setting nurseries, 
organizing biood donation camps   

Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  

Aga Khan 
Foundation  

Awareness programs, self help 
groups, FPS, capacity building 
workshops 2018 

Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  

Blind People's 
Association 

Hospital surveys, digitization for 
health programs 2018 

Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  

Chaitanya 

Survey of women empowerment, 
teaching, digital intiatives, skill 
development 2018 

Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  

Development 
Support Centre field surveys of panchayats, e-camps 2018 

Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  ESI Sughad  

Cleanliness surveys, child education, 
Health management  2018 

Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  GKSM Trust  

Primary school teaching, profession 
and financial surveys, awareness 2018 

Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  

Grahmin Seva 
Aashram 

Women self help groups,  swatch 
bharat abhiyan, farmer clubs 2018 

Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  

GVT 

Surveys, women self help groups, 
awareness of modern agricultural 
techniques 2018 

Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  

HESCO 

Survey on Ecological Child Rights, 
rehabilitation of water sources, 
survey on agriculture production 2018 

Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  

Hesco Dehradun 

Survey on Ecological Child Rights, 
rehabilitation of water sources, 
survey on agriculture production 2018 

Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  

HIFEED 
Uttarakhand 

market survey, interaction with 
farmers 2018 

Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  

Incredible 
Himachal 

tree plantation, blood donation 
camps, rural development 2018 

Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  Ishwar 

survey on Anganvadis, quality of 
food, education 2018 

Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  

Maitri Manthan 

health care awareness for women, 
medical camp, using google form to 
save paper and money 2018 

Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  

Manthan Gramin 

Primary education, community 
organization, watershed 
development 2018 

Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  ANarDe 

survey local needs, financial literacy 
awareness, hygiene 2018 

Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  

National Centre 
for Human 
Settlements and 
Environment 

watershed development, monitoring 
and evaluation studies of rural 
development 2018 

Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  Navchetna 

healthcare, livelihood enhancement 
for girls 2018 

Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  Navjeevan 

socialand medical awareness camps, 
child development, education 2018 

Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  

Pratham 
Education 
Foundation child and elementary education   

Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  

Parvatiya Jan 
Kalyan Sansthan 

natural resource management, 
health survey, women empowerment 2018 

Weblink 

http://intranet.daiict.ac.in/~daiict_nt01/NAAC-CYCLE-2/7.2.1_Supporting-Documents/Rural%20Internships%20Report-Year-2017/UETS_201601108/
http://intranet.daiict.ac.in/~daiict_nt01/NAAC-CYCLE-2/7.2.1_Supporting-Documents/Rural%20Internships%20Report-Year-2017/VidhyaBhawan_201601416/
http://intranet.daiict.ac.in/~daiict_nt01/NAAC-CYCLE-2/7.2.1_Supporting-Documents/Rural%20Internships%20Report-Year-2017/Yuva%20Unstoppable_201601245/
http://intranet.daiict.ac.in/~daiict_nt01/NAAC-CYCLE-2/7.2.1_Supporting-Documents/Rural%20Internships%20Report-Year-2017/UETS_201601108/
http://intranet.daiict.ac.in/~daiict_nt01/NAAC-CYCLE-2/7.2.1_Supporting-Documents/Rural%20Internships%20Report-Year-2017/UETS_201601108/
http://intranet.daiict.ac.in/~daiict_nt01/NAAC-CYCLE-2/7.2.1_Supporting-Documents/Rural%20Internships%20Report-Year-2017/UETS_201601108/
http://intranet.daiict.ac.in/~daiict_nt01/NAAC-CYCLE-2/7.2.1_Supporting-Documents/Rural%20Internships%20Report-Year-2017/UETS_201601108/
http://intranet.daiict.ac.in/~daiict_nt01/NAAC-CYCLE-2/7.2.1_Supporting-Documents/Rural%20Internships%20Report-Year-2017/UETS_201601108/
http://intranet.daiict.ac.in/~daiict_nt01/NAAC-CYCLE-2/7.2.1_Supporting-Documents/Rural%20Internships%20Report-Year-2017/UETS_201601108/
http://intranet.daiict.ac.in/~daiict_nt01/NAAC-CYCLE-2/7.2.1_Supporting-Documents/Rural%20Internships%20Report-Year-2017/UETS_201601108/
http://intranet.daiict.ac.in/~daiict_nt01/NAAC-CYCLE-2/7.2.1_Supporting-Documents/Rural%20Internships%20Report-Year-2017/UETS_201601108/
http://intranet.daiict.ac.in/~daiict_nt01/NAAC-CYCLE-2/7.2.1_Supporting-Documents/Rural%20Internships%20Report-Year-2017/UETS_201601108/
http://intranet.daiict.ac.in/~daiict_nt01/NAAC-CYCLE-2/7.2.1_Supporting-Documents/Rural%20Internships%20Report-Year-2017/UETS_201601108/
http://intranet.daiict.ac.in/~daiict_nt01/NAAC-CYCLE-2/7.2.1_Supporting-Documents/Rural%20Internships%20Report-Year-2017/UETS_201601108/
http://intranet.daiict.ac.in/~daiict_nt01/NAAC-CYCLE-2/7.2.1_Supporting-Documents/Rural%20Internships%20Report-Year-2017/UETS_201601108/
http://intranet.daiict.ac.in/~daiict_nt01/NAAC-CYCLE-2/7.2.1_Supporting-Documents/Rural%20Internships%20Report-Year-2017/UETS_201601108/
http://intranet.daiict.ac.in/~daiict_nt01/NAAC-CYCLE-2/7.2.1_Supporting-Documents/Rural%20Internships%20Report-Year-2017/UETS_201601108/
http://intranet.daiict.ac.in/~daiict_nt01/NAAC-CYCLE-2/7.2.1_Supporting-Documents/Rural%20Internships%20Report-Year-2017/UETS_201601108/
http://intranet.daiict.ac.in/~daiict_nt01/NAAC-CYCLE-2/7.2.1_Supporting-Documents/Rural%20Internships%20Report-Year-2017/UETS_201601108/
http://intranet.daiict.ac.in/~daiict_nt01/NAAC-CYCLE-2/7.2.1_Supporting-Documents/Rural%20Internships%20Report-Year-2017/UETS_201601108/
http://intranet.daiict.ac.in/~daiict_nt01/NAAC-CYCLE-2/7.2.1_Supporting-Documents/Rural%20Internships%20Report-Year-2017/UETS_201601108/
http://intranet.daiict.ac.in/~daiict_nt01/NAAC-CYCLE-2/7.2.1_Supporting-Documents/Rural%20Internships%20Report-Year-2017/UETS_201601108/
http://intranet.daiict.ac.in/~daiict_nt01/NAAC-CYCLE-2/7.2.1_Supporting-Documents/?_ga=2.100923267.307504343.1676359252-725519263.1675962876
http://intranet.daiict.ac.in/~daiict_nt01/NAAC-CYCLE-2/7.2.1_Supporting-Documents/?_ga=2.100923267.307504343.1676359252-725519263.1675962876
http://intranet.daiict.ac.in/~daiict_nt01/NAAC-CYCLE-2/7.2.1_Supporting-Documents/?_ga=2.100923267.307504343.1676359252-725519263.1675962876


camps 

Rural 
Internship  

Peoples Welfare 
Society 

prompting women self help groups, 
societal services 2018 

Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  PNR Society  

Empowering disabled youths with 
computer skills  2018 

Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  Pratham  

Research and evaluation of early 
interventions, digital initiatives 2018 

Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  Pratibha  

teaching English, computer skills, 
women rights awareness camps 2018 

Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  Ruchi  

surveys, slum visit and arranging 
medical camps, water suppy 2018 

Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  Sahjeevan survey of farmers, agriculture 2018 

Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  

Sanskar Seva 
Samit 

family health awareness, surveys on 
demographics 2018 

Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  

Sarthi Godhar 

surveys, training farmers for 
insurance schemes, encouraging 
villagers for voting during elections 2018 

Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  

Bolbala 
Charitable Trust survey, medical camps 2018 

Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  Sristi  

awareness building, documentation, 
policy analysis 2018 

Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  Sutra Bani  

conducting surveys, identify health 
schemes 2018 

Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  Sutra Solan  

conducting surveys, identify health 
schemes 2018 

Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  Voice 4 Girls 

Education for adolescent girls,  
health awareness 2018 

Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  Yuva Unstoppable  

Organizing talent programs, teaching 
2018 

Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  

Ajeet Rural 
Development 
Foundation 

community level development action 
groups for women and unpriviledged 
children 2019 

Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  

Akshaya Patra 
Food distribution, surveys 2019 

Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  

Apna Ghar 
Ashram 

Education, inventory & Medical 
awareness camps 2019 

Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  

Aryasamaj, 
Visavadar 

Cleanliness & Helping in Medical 
Camp 2019 

Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  

Blind People's 
Association 

Hospital surveys, digitization for 
health programs 2019 

Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  

Bolbala 
Charitable trust survey, medical camps 2019 

Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  

Edu care India 
Waste management programs, blood 
donation camps 2019 

Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  

ESI Sughad 
Cleanliness surveys, child education, 
Health management  2019 

Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  

GKSM Trust 
Kamrej 

education, introduction of modern 
computers and technology, survey on 
religion, financial-condition, 
agriculture, resources etc. 2019 

Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  

GKSM Trust Vyara 

education, introduction of modern 
computers and technology, survey on 
religion, financial-condition, 
agriculture, resources etc. 2019 

Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  

Gramin Sewa 
Ashram Himachal 

Women self help groups,  swatch 
bharat abhiyan, farmer clubs 2019 

Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  

HiFEED Dehradun 
market survey, interaction with 
farmers 2019 

Weblink 

Rural 
Internship  

Incredible 
Himachal Pradesh 

tree plantation, blood donation 
camps, rural development 2019 

Weblink 

Rural Ishwar Gram survey on Anganvadis, quality of 2019 Weblink 

http://intranet.daiict.ac.in/~daiict_nt01/NAAC-CYCLE-2/7.2.1_Supporting-Documents/?_ga=2.100923267.307504343.1676359252-725519263.1675962876
http://intranet.daiict.ac.in/~daiict_nt01/NAAC-CYCLE-2/7.2.1_Supporting-Documents/?_ga=2.100923267.307504343.1676359252-725519263.1675962876
http://intranet.daiict.ac.in/~daiict_nt01/NAAC-CYCLE-2/7.2.1_Supporting-Documents/?_ga=2.100923267.307504343.1676359252-725519263.1675962876
http://intranet.daiict.ac.in/~daiict_nt01/NAAC-CYCLE-2/7.2.1_Supporting-Documents/?_ga=2.100923267.307504343.1676359252-725519263.1675962876
http://intranet.daiict.ac.in/~daiict_nt01/NAAC-CYCLE-2/7.2.1_Supporting-Documents/?_ga=2.100923267.307504343.1676359252-725519263.1675962876
http://intranet.daiict.ac.in/~daiict_nt01/NAAC-CYCLE-2/7.2.1_Supporting-Documents/?_ga=2.100923267.307504343.1676359252-725519263.1675962876
http://intranet.daiict.ac.in/~daiict_nt01/NAAC-CYCLE-2/7.2.1_Supporting-Documents/?_ga=2.100923267.307504343.1676359252-725519263.1675962876
http://intranet.daiict.ac.in/~daiict_nt01/NAAC-CYCLE-2/7.2.1_Supporting-Documents/?_ga=2.100923267.307504343.1676359252-725519263.1675962876
http://intranet.daiict.ac.in/~daiict_nt01/NAAC-CYCLE-2/7.2.1_Supporting-Documents/?_ga=2.100923267.307504343.1676359252-725519263.1675962876
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Internship Vikas Trust, Patan food, education 

Rural 
Internship 

J.v Naria,
jamnagar

survey on NGO functioning NGO, 
spreading awareness on child 
helpline no., giving information on 
garbage collecting van 2019 

Weblink 

Rural 
Internship 

Kasturba 
Sevashram 

Education, mental health and de-
addiction camps, creating digital 
storage solutions 2019 

Weblink 

Rural 
Internship 

NGO ISHWAR, 
GANDHINAGAR 

survey on Anganvadis, quality of 
food, education 2019 

Weblink 

Rural 
Internship 

Parvatiya Jan 
Kalyan Sansthan 

natural resource management, 
health survey, women empowerment 
camps 2019 

Weblink 

Rural 
Internship 

People's Welfare 
Society, Junagadh 

survey of govt. schools, panchayat 
visit, interaction with villagers 
regarding Demonetization 2019 

Weblink 

Rural 
Internship 

PNR Society 
Empowering disabled youths with 
computer skills  2019 

Weblink 

Rural 
Internship 

Pratibha 
foundation 

teaching English, computer skills, 
women rights awareness camps 2019 

Weblink 

Rural 
Internship 

Rajasthan Mahila 
Kalyan Mandal 
Sanstha, Ajmer 

Child education, mental health 
awareness camps 2019 

Weblink 

Rural 
Internship 

Seven Sisters 
Development 
Assistanse 
(SeSTA) 

self help groups, capacity building, 
empowering women 2019 

Weblink 

Rural 
Internship 

Shiv Shiksha 
Samiti, Ranoli, 
Tonk 

Education, child protection, health 
awareness camps 2019 

Weblink 

Rural 
Internship 

Shree Mateshwari 
Vikas Seva Samiti 

Teaching basic math, English and an 
introduction to computer to primary 
school kids 2019 

Weblink 

Rural 
Internship 

SUTRA 
conducting surveys, identify health 
schemes 2019 

Weblink 

Rural 
Internship 

Tagore Society for 
Rural 
Development, 
West Bengal 

Teaching, health awareness camps. 

2019 

Weblink 

Rural 
Internship 

Tara Sansthan, 
Udaipur 

women upliftment, eye check up 
camps, education for children 2019 

Weblink 

Rural 
Internship 

UETS, AP 
developing techincal solutions for 
disabled children 2019 

Weblink 

Rural 
Internship 

Vanvasi Kalyan 
Ashram, 
Ahmedabad tribal development, health camps 2019 

Weblink 

Rural 
Internship 

VRTI, Bhavnagar 
education, soil health management, 
agriculture survey 2019 

Weblink 

Rural 
Internship 

Yuva Unstoppable Organizing talent programs, teaching 
2019 

Weblink 
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Blood Donation Camp 

 3rd Oct, 2017 

Sambhav, DA-IICT 

Blood donation camps are regularly organized once in a semester. Goal is to 

educate people for blood donation and spread its awareness among the youth 

and its benefits.This time we conducted Blood Donation Camp in association with 

the ndian Red Cross Society. The camp is organized the whole day from 4:30 PM 

to 10:00 PM. we managed to collect 161 units of blood.  

Committee members included:- Rudra Chandak, Ajay Shamla, Aneri Patel, 

Bhavesh Khatnani, Pratik Wankhede, Rishi Bhatt, Saumya Doshi, Khushil Mistry 

Volunteers included:- Yes 

Venue:- Faculty mess, Near Koffee++ 

Schedule:- 4:30 pm onwards (till 10 pm) 

Best part of the event:- We managed to collect 161 units of blood. :) 

Event Photos (4-6) 



 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



Old Age Home Visit 

Sambhav 

This was our first visit this year. We are associated with Rahelba Vruddhashram 

from many years. We try to help them in many ways. We were 30 odd students 

this time. It was 2 hours visit. This was the first kind of such visit for many 

students. Many students were bit nervous. But after reaching there, all 

nervousness went away. Wa had great conversation with them. There were 

around 40 residents. 

Venue:- Rahelba Vruddhashram 
 

Schedule:- 31st October, 2017 (Tuesday) 

 Time : 4:00 PM 

Number of performers/ participants:- 30 
 

Event Photos (4-6) 
 

 

 
 



 

Students Activities 

Name of the 
Club 

Name of the Event Date 
   Participants 

(External Colleges etc.) 
Affiliation 

(B. tech, Mtech etc) 

Sambhav Vigyan Shala visit 18/08/2018 Students ALL 

Sambhav Book Sale 20/018/2018 Students ALL 

Sambhav Swachhata Hi Seva 
15/09/2018 - 
02/10/2018 

Students, Faculty, Staff ALL 

Sambhav Blood Donation Camp 31/10/2018 Students, Faculty, Staff ALL 

Sambhav Open meeting 16/01/2019 Students ALL 

Sambhav Orphanage Visit 19/01/2019 Students ALL 

Sambhav Book Sale 22/01/2019 Students ALL 

Sambhav Vigyan Shala visit 09/02/2019 Students ALL 

Sambhav Vigyan Shala visit 02/03/2019 Students ALL 

Sambhav Blood Donation Camp 03/04/2019 Students, Faculty, Staff ALL 

Sambhav 
Donation of cooler to 

Orphanage 
05/04/2019 Students ALL 




